
Tahoe Beach & Ski
Sealed 
Bid No

 
Successful Bidders

Bid 
Amount

 
Parcel Number

Default 
No

Results of Sealed Bid Tax Sale February 21, 2003

062292500-119-25-100$3,000.00TUPPER JULIE E101

062581500-168-66-100$2,601.00CHESTER CHERYL ANN BLY102

062343500-130-95-100$2,501.00PETERSON BRETT L102

062571500-167-79-100$1,712.00BONDERUD ROBERT J, 
BONDERUD PATRIC

102

062592500-169-79-100$1,601.00CORNELL DAROLD102

062271500-113-46-100$1,504.00CHEVALIER LAWRENCE E102

062563500-167-29-100$1,403.00WEMESFELDER STEPHEN102

062569500-167-68-100$1,403.00WEMESFELDER STEPHEN102

WITHDRAWN 062574500-168-22-100102

062560500-166-90-100$1,376.00KIMMINAU MARCELLA103

062319500-124-51-100$1,050.00HELD SCOTT L103

062433500-149-22-100$2,501.00SCHULZE HENRY V104

062497500-160-56-100$2,003.50SHERWOOD LARRY D104

062540500-164-02-100$1,635.00WARD PATTI, WARD HARRY A104

062376500-137-81-100$1,600.00STARCHMAN DONALD J104

062289500-118-57-100$1,402.00KIMMINAU MARCELLA104

062399500-141-41-100$1,350.00GERRY KATHLEEN105

062449500-152-17-100$1,101.00JONES JANICE105

062580500-168-60-100$1,100.00GABB RAY ANTHONY105

062440500-150-20-100$2,501.00PETERSON BRETT L106

062430500-148-51-100$1,852.00HULSE RANDALL G, 
THOMPSON MARY JO

106

062410500-144-38-100$1,600.00SHOVA BARBARA A106

062555500-166-51-100$1,450.00HILL MICHAEL106
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062372500-136-95-100$1,221.00CATADO HELEN O106

062445500-151-22-100$1,211.00CATADO HELEN O106

062269500-113-05-100$1,200.00MATA JOSEFA M106

062382500-138-68-100$1,157.00HOLTON W KELLEY106

062351500-132-08-100$1,131.00CATADO HELEN O106

062533500-163-52-100$1,121.00CATADO HELEN O106

REDEEMED 062379500-138-31-100106

062594500-170-03-100$1,100.00JONES JANICE107

062595500-170-08-100$991.00DAILEY CAROLYN J107

062258500-111-44-100$973.00HOLTON W KELLEY107

NO BID 062550500-165-38-100108

062568500-167-65-100$1,000.00JONES JANICE109

NO BID 062492500-159-62-100110

NO BID 062501500-160-85-100110

NO BID 062486500-158-95-100110

NO BID 062412500-144-62-100111

062223500-101-13-100$1,100.00STARCHMAN DONALD J112

062302500-121-42-100$850.00MATA JOSEFA M112

062242500-106-76-100$800.00HEAGY ROBERT W JR112

062276500-114-97-100$755.00BAUMGRATZ DONALD G112

REDEEMED 050509500-141-96-100113

062498500-160-60-100$3,000.00TUPPER JULIE E114

NO BID 062561500-166-93-100115
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062536500-163-75-100$900.00MATA JOSEFA M116

062507500-161-34-100$700.00GRUNEICH MARTIN F JR116

NO BID 062565500-167-50-100116

062583500-168-99-100$1,402.00FITZGERALD LEON T117

062384500-139-17-100$1,200.00MATA JOSEFA M117

062261500-112-03-100$1,000.00MANOTOK JOSE L117


