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058385500-069-36-100$1,200.00TATE NORMA JEAN1

062040500-055-37-100$1,001.50AMENT THOMAS W1

058157500-014-13-100$1,001.00VAMEGHI MASSOUD1

058279500-049-45-100$1,000.00GILES SHARON1

054772500-042-29-100$1,000.00BLANTON PAUL E1

054798500-048-92-100$1,000.00INSURANCE TRANSACTORS 
INC, DICARO

1

062183500-090-59-100$950.00STONE WILLIAM F1

061938500-028-11-100$801.00HUBBARD SEAN, CLEARVIEW 
ASSOCIATES

1

058517500-090-72-100$801.00HUBBARD SEAN, CLEARVIEW 
ASSOCIATES

1

058307500-056-62-100$801.00HUBBARD SEAN, CLEARVIEW 
ASSOCIATES

1

062149500-082-53-100$801.00HUBBARD SEAN, CLEARVIEW 
ASSOCIATES

1

049832500-012-58-100$801.00HUBBARD SEAN, CLEARVIEW 
ASSOCIATES

1

058177500-019-35-100$800.00HAMILTON WILLIAM E1

058461500-082-04-100$800.00ANGIN SHIRLEY J1

045914500-024-33-100$800.00KINGSFORD RONALD1

062094500-071-87-100$798.00ANGIN SHIRLEY J1

041411500-077-11-100$779.00ANGIN RONALD J SR1

058245500-040-84-100$755.00TIDRICK GALEN1

058198500-026-08-100$754.00LOWERS CHARLES L1

061937500-027-79-100$754.00LOWERS CHARLES L1

058314500-057-43-100$754.00TIDRICK GALEN1
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050044500-060-36-100$753.00TIDRICK GALEN1

058528500-093-10-100$752.00TIDRICK GALEN1

061967500-035-90-100$751.00TIDRICK GALEN S1

061904500-018-82-100$725.00SABALA CHARLES1

061907500-019-58-100$725.00GRILLI MARTIN1

061927500-025-20-100$705.00NUCKLES GINNIE1

058250500-042-42-100$700.00ATKINSON PAUL1

062138500-080-59-100$700.00ATKINSON PAUL1

061959500-033-35-100$700.00ATKINSON PAUL1

NO BID 058371500-067-86-1001

NO BID 062210500-097-83-1001

NO BID 058147500-011-59-1001

NO BID 058189500-023-87-1001

NO BID 062150500-082-75-1001

NO BID 058199500-026-11-1001

NO BID 058256500-043-46-1001

NO BID 058297500-054-54-1001

NO BID 058351500-064-71-1001

NO BID 062091500-070-19-1001

NO BID 061906500-019-54-1001

NO BID 062055500-060-94-1001

NO BID 062051500-060-10-1001

NO BID 062068500-064-11-1001
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NO BID 058347500-064-43-1001

NO BID 062215500-099-34-1001

NO BID 062060500-062-79-1001

062006500-046-70-100$3,000.00YEE BARBARA L2

062047500-057-91-100$3,000.00JEWELL JAMES  M D2

062078500-065-88-100$1,710.00BACKLUND VIRGIL L2

062079500-066-70-100$1,516.00BOLANDER GARY2

062043500-056-06-100$1,515.00BOLANDER GARY2

062011500-047-63-100$1,501.00VAMEGHI MASSOUD2

061946500-029-80-100$1,450.00MOLINAR TERESA2

062107500-075-51-100$1,300.00STONE WILLIAM F2

062134500-079-79-100$1,269.00LIEBER RALPH2

061996500-043-41-100$1,250.00ODETTE ROBERT, ODETTE 
JANICE

2

062073500-065-11-100$1,200.00EMPEY C DREW2

062031500-053-84-100$1,198.35LABORDE ALFRED2

061894500-016-36-100$1,155.00BERNSTEIN ROBERT OWEN2

062187500-091-88-100$1,125.00FIZDALE STEPHEN, 
ROSENFELD RACHEL

2

062179500-089-79-100$1,061.00BURGHOFFER LEO L2

062201500-096-50-100$1,500.00INSURANCE TRANSACTORS 
INC, DICARO

3

058537500-096-70-100$776.00TIDRICK GALEN3

041302500-064-70-100$775.00TIDRICK GALEN3

058330500-061-70-100$750.00JOHNSON ROSE P3
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046200500-096-41-100$710.00KLEMENT MARGARET3

041655500-096-31-100$705.00HAYES JAMES W3

058433500-077-39-100$700.00ATKINSON PAUL3

062203500-096-77-100$700.00ATKINSON PAUL3

NO BID 062209500-097-63-1003

062213500-098-68-100$1,500.00STONE WILLIAM F4

041525500-089-93-100$1,098.35OLIVAS VIRGINIA5

058407500-073-23-100$726.50ANDERSON DARYL J5

041693500-097-81-100$700.00ATKINSON PAUL5

062182500-090-58-100$700.00ATKINSON PAUL5

NO BID 062142500-081-10-1005

NO BID 062124500-078-50-1005

061983500-040-31-100$1,251.00DONE HEIDI A6


